

FLORIDA STATE UNIVERSITY
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Attachment B - Category 2 Pricing (Long Distance, 90 Miles or More) 

Rate Per Mile
	Passenger Capacity
	2023-2024
	2024-2025
	2025-2026
	2026-2027
	2027-2028
	2028-2029
	2029-2030
	2030-2031

	1-25
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	26-39
	5.59
	6.04
	6.53
	7.06
	7.63
	8.25
	8.92
	9.64

	40-56+
	5.59
	6.04
	6.53
	7.06
	7.63
	8.25
	8.92
	9.64



NOTE:  Category 2 Pricing will be determined by the greater of:  A.  a charge based on the mileage rate above or B.  A minimum daily rate of below.  Pricing is based on utilization of the bus for a daily maximum of 10 hours per day.  Afterwards, an hourly rate for hours in excess of 10 hours, as detailed in Attachment A, will apply.

Rate Per Day
	Passenger Capacity
	2023-2024
	2024-2025
	2025-2026
	2026-2027
	2027-2028
	2028-2029
	2029-2030
	2030-2031

	1-25
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid
	No bid

	26-39
	1,955
	2,113
	2,285
	2,470
	2,670
	2,886
	3,120
	3,372

	40-56+
	2,028
	2,193
	2,420
	2,616
	2,915
	3,152
	3,407
	3,683




Other Fees (please list in detail):
Venue or city parking as applicable
As noted in the Specifications for the ITN, all lodging costs are the responsibility of FSU.  Drivers should be assigned single rooms.
Charge for Driver Change:  Not to exceed $2,235 per driver for each day a driver change is needed.  A trip requiring a single driver change on departure day and return day will be charged this amount twice. 
Any trips requiring more than 5 buses will incur a $4.00 per mile deadhead charge in addition to the calculated price according to the NOTE above.

