

## Attachment A Annett Bus Lines

### Category 1 (Tallahassee Local Service) Pricing

#### One Way Pricing

##### **Shuttle Service FSU/Tallahassee Airport Flat Rates**

Passenger Capacity	2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
1-25	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
26-39	\$753	\$776	\$799	\$823	\$848
40-56+	\$781	\$804	\$829	\$853	\$879

##### **Shuttle Service FSU/Donald L. Tucker Center Flat Rates**

Passenger Capacity	2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
1-25	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
26-39	\$727	\$749	\$771	\$794	\$818
40-56+	\$749	\$771	\$795	\$818	\$843

#### Local Trips Pricing (Within Tallahassee and Surrounding Areas, Less than 90 Miles)

##### **Local Trips Daily Rate Pricing (x)**

Passenger Capacity	2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
1-25	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
26-39	\$1,053	\$1,085	\$1,117	\$1,151	\$1,185
40-56+	\$1,196	\$1,232	\$1,269	\$1,307	\$1,346

##### **Local Trips Mileage Pricing**

Passenger Capacity	2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
1-25	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
26-39	\$4.32	\$4.45	\$4.58	\$4.72	\$4.86
40-56+	\$4.43	\$4.56	\$4.70	\$4.84	\$4.99

(x) Daily rate is based on a 10-hour day. Additional charge per hour will be \$114/hour beyond 10 hours.

\* Local Trip price will be the greater of Daily Rate or Mileage Rate pricing

\*\* Years are FSU Fiscal Years: July 1 – June 30

## Attachment B Annett Bus Lines

### Category 2 (Long Distance, 90 Miles or More) Pricing

#### Long Distance Rate per Mile

Passenger Capacity	2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
1-25	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
26-39	\$4.32	\$4.45	\$4.58	\$4.72	\$4.86
40-56+	\$4.43	\$4.56	\$4.70	\$4.84	\$4.99

#### Long Distance Daily Rate

Passenger Capacity	2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
1-25	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
26-39	\$1,053	\$1,085	\$1,117	\$1,151	\$1,185
40-56+	\$1,196	\$1,232	\$1,269	\$1,307	\$1,346

\* Long Distance price will be the greater of Daily Rate or Mileage Rate pricing

**NOTE:** Any trips requiring 5 or more buses will incur a \$3.00 per mile deadhead charge in addition to the calculated price based on the greater of the daily or mileage rate.

#### Driver Change Rate

2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
\$1,500	\$1,500	\$1,500	\$1,500	\$1,500

**NOTE:** Driver change rate will be \$600 if the change can be accomplished near one of our facilities in Panama City, Madison, Jacksonville, Ocala or Sebring.

Is Chase Vehicle (Service Truck w/Mechanic) offered for trips with 4 or more buses for distances greater than 250 miles or out of state? Yes  No

If yes, provide pricing:

#### Chase Vehicle (Service Truck w/Mechanic) Daily Rate Pricing

2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
No charge	No charge	No charge	No charge	No charge

\*\* Years are FSU Fiscal Years: July 1 – June 30

**Attachment C  
Annett Bus Lines**

**Category 3 (Out-of-Town Local Service) Pricing**

**Daily Rates (x)**

Passenger Capacity	2018-2019	2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023
1-25	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
26-39	\$1,173	\$1,208	\$1,244	\$1,282	\$1,320
40-56+	\$1,193	\$1,229	\$1,266	\$1,304	\$1,343

(x) Daily rate is based on a 10-hour day. Additional charge per hour will be \$114/hour beyond 10 hours.

**\*\* Years are FSU Fiscal Years: July 1 – June 30**